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Council Direction: 
 
At the August 11, 2011, Council meeting, City Council received correspondence from 
the Dundas Museum & Archives regarding proposed changes to the museum property 
at 133 - 139 Park Street West (Dundas).  Specifically, the letter (attached as Appendix 
“A”) requested that the fees for a required Zoning By-law Amendment application be 
waived or reduced.  The request was received by Council, and referred to the General 
Manager of the Planning and Economic Development Department for a report to the 
Planning Committee. 
 
Information: 
 
The Dundas Museum & Archives is located at 133 - 139 Park Street West (Dundas).  
133 - 139 Park Street West is one parcel, which contains the Museum (139 Park Street 
West) and an existing single detached dwelling, which is currently used for residential 
purposes (133 Park Street West).  The Museum is proposing to change the use of this 
dwelling to office and storage space for the museum archives.  All of the changes would 
be within the existing building.  
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In May, 2011, a Request for Formal Consultation to the Planning and Economic 
Development Department was submitted on behalf of the Museum regarding the 
proposed changes to 133 Park Street West.  The Formal Consultation process provides 
an opportunity for City staff to review development proposals and identify any required 
studies or applications that are needed to implement the proposal.  Through the Formal 
Consultation process, the applicant was notified that a Zoning By-law Amendment 
Application (Complex) would be required to implement the proposal, as the current Low 
Density Residential (R4) Zone on the subject lands would not permit the office and 
storage uses.  The Complex Zoning By-law Amendment would be required to rezone 
the subject lands at 133 Park Street West from the existing Low Density Residential 
(R4) Zone to the Public and Private Service (PPS) Zone.  The change to the PPS Zone 
would permit the office and storage uses for the Museum archives, and would also 
eliminate the split zoning, which is currently on the property, as 139 Park Street West 
(the Museum) is currently within the PPS Zone.  In addition, the applicant was notified 
that the fee for a Complex Zoning By-law Amendment Application is $11,540.00. 
 
The City of Hamilton Planning and Economic Development Fee Schedule recognizes 
two types of Zoning By-law Amendment Applications.  Complex applications, at a fee of 
$11,540.00, are generally those applications that propose a change in zoning from one 
zone category to a different zone category, or that propose multiple modifications to an 
existing zoning category.  Routine applications, at a fee of $5,770.00, are generally 
those applications that propose a modification to an existing zoning category, such as to 
permit an additional use within an existing zone.  The current application fees were 
established in 2009 (plus CPI adjustments) based on a comprehensive analysis of the 
cost of service delivery to recoup the actual cost of processing and administering 
development approvals.   
 
While the Formal Consultation document identified the need for a Complex Zoning     
By-law Amendment application for the subject proposal, in an effort to reduce the cost 
for this non-profit organization, Planning staff would be supportive of alternatively 
dealing with the proposal through a Routine Zoning By-law Amendment application.  
The Routine application would maintain the existing Low Density Residential (R4) Zone 
on 133 Park Street West, and add the proposed office and storage uses for the 
Museum archive as an additional permitted use on the property.  While this would not 
have the effect of eliminating the split zoning on the property, it would have the effect of 
reducing the total fees required from $11,540.00 to $5,770.00 (a 50% reduction in fees).  
Further, staff notes that the $310.00 Formal Consultation application fee (already paid 
by the Museum) would be credited toward any future required application fees.  
Therefore, should the proposal be dealt with through a Routine rezoning application, the 
total Zoning By-law Amendment application fees required to be paid by the Museum 
would be $5,460.00.  The Department is not supportive of waiving the fees entirely as 
our cost of service delivery for applications is substantially funded from reserves. 
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Appendix: 
 
• Appendix “A”: Letter to Councillor Powers from C.E. Crozier, President and Board 

 Chair, Dundas Museum & Archives 
 
 
:HT 
Attach. (1) 
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